35

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette

‘Monday 4t April, 2016

S1.No.l1

M
[Legal Notice No. 14]

MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENTS) COMMISSION

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2016

Table of provisions

Citation

Commencement

Regulations amended
Amendment of regulation 9
Amendment of regulation 11D
Amendment of regulation 33
Amendment of regulation 41
Amendment of regulation 70

0 NN WV A W=

W WD NN




36

MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENTS) COMMISSION
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2016

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 69B(2) of the Constitution, the
Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission makes the following
Regulations:

1 Citation

These Regulations may be cited as the Members of Parliament
(Entitlments) Commission (Amendment) Regulations 2016.

2 Commencement

These Regulations commence on the date they are published in the
Gazette.

3 Regulations amended

These Regulations amend the Members of Parliament (Entitlements)
Commission Regulations 1988.

4 Amendment of regulation 9

€)) Regulation 9(3)(b)(i) is amended by deleting “or such other
amount within the limits as approved by Parliament”.

) Regulation 9(3)(b)(ii) is amended by deleting “the whole or”.

3) Regulation 9(3)(b)(ii) is amended by deleting “purposes” and
substituting “purposes, which must not include financing home
loan payments for any person,”.

5 Amendment of regulation 11D

) Regulation 11D(1) is amended by deleting “The” and inserting
“With the exception of a recipient who is medically certified
to be wholly dependent on care provided by another person and
incapacitated, the”.

3] Regulation 11D(1) is amended by deleting “When he ceases
to be a Member” and substituting “When the recipient ceases
to be a Member and reaches the age of 50 years”.




37
Amendment of regulation 33
I Regulation 33(1) is amended by deleting “request” and
substituting “request and are not otherwise accommodated by
the Government”.
) Regulation 33(1) is amended by:
(a) deleting “$9,000” and substituting “$15,000”"; and
®) deleting “$15,000” and substituting “$20,000”.
3) Regulation 33(2) is amended by:
(a) deleting “$9,000” and substituting “$15,000”; and
(b) deleting “$15,000” and substituting “$20,000”.

Amendment of regulation 41

Regulation 41(7) is amended by deleting “$7,000” and substituting
“$15,000”.

Amendment of regulation 70

Regulation 70(1) is amended by deleting “for fourteen or more
consecutive days”.

MADE IN HONIARA this first day of April, 2016.

CHAIRMAN
MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENTS) COMMISSION




Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the
Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Pacific Printers Limited.




