
EXTRA ORDINARY GAZETTE

The following is published as a Supplement to this Gazette:

[Legal Notice Nos: 70  to 71]

______________________________________________________________

[156]

IMMIGRATION ACT

(CAP. 60)

EXEMPTION ORDER

IN exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7(1)(g) of the Immigration Act

(Cap. 60), the Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment hereby

exempts:

GEOFFREY WILLIAM GEVER

from the requirements of Section 6(1) of the said Immigration Act.

Dated at Honiara this thirtieth day of July, 2004.

WALTON NAEZON

Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment

_____________________________________________________________

153

NO. 34 Thursday       28th July,                                                   2005



154

[157]

IMMIGRATION ACT

(CAP. 60)

EXEMPTION ORDER

IN exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7(g) of the Immigration Act 

(Cap. 60), the Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment hereby

exempts.

ROLLO JOHN RICHARD HOVELL

from the requirements of Section 6(1) of the said Immigration Act.

Dated at Honiara this eighteenth day of April, 2005.

WALTON NAEZON

Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment

________________________________________________________________

[158]

IMMIGRATION ACT

(CAP. 60)

EXEMPTION ORDER

IN exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7(g) of the Immigration Act (Cap.

60), the Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment hereby exempts:

CORNELIUS KELETS

from the requirements of Section 6(1) of the said Immigration Act.

Dated at Honiara this fourth day of July, 2005.

WALTON NAEZON

Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment

________________________________________________________________



155

[159]

IMMIGRATION ACT

(CAP. 60)

EXEMPTION ORDER

IN exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7(1) g of the Immigration Act

(Cap. 60), the Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment hereby

exempts:-

VINCENT HART

SUSAN MACIE

from the requirements of Section 6 (1) of the said Immigration Act.

Dated at Honiara this twenty-third day of June, 2005.

TREVOR OLAVAE

Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment

_________________________________________________________________

[160]

IMMIGRATION ACT

(Cap. 60)

EXEMPTION ORDER

IN exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7(g) of the Immigration Act, the

Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment hereby exempts -

Sr. MARGARET ANN TISCH

from the requirements of Section 6(1) of the said Act for the period from the date

hereof until 31st December 2003.

Dated at Honiara this twentieth day of April, 2003.

TREVOR OLAVAE

Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment

_________________________________________________________________



[161]

IMMIGRATION ACT

(Cap. 60)

REVOCATION ORDER

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 7(g) of the Immigration Act, the

Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment hereby revokes the

Exemption Order granted in respect of RORY WILLIAM STEWART with effect

from the date hereof.

Dated at Honiara this twentieth day of June, 2005.

WALTON NAEZON 

Minister of Commerce, Industries and Employment

________________________________________________________________

[162]

THE SOLOMON ISLANDS INDEPENDENCE ORDER 1978

(L.N. No. 43 of 1978)

APPOINTMENT OF ACTING CHIEF JUSTICE

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 79(1) of the Constitution and 

acting in accordance with the advice of the Judicial and Legal Service

Commission, I, SIR, NATHANIEL RAHUMAEA WAENA, Knight Grand Cross

of the Most Distinguish Order of Saint Michael and Saint George, Cross of the

Order of Solomon Islands, Knight of Saint John, Governor-General and

Commander-in-Chief of Solomon Islands, do hereby appoint -

EDWIN GOLDSBOROUGH

to be Acting Chief Justice of Solomon Islands from 21st July 2005 to 4th of

August 2005.

Given in Honiara under my hand and the public Seal this twenty-sixth day of

July, 2005.

NATHANIEL R WAENA

Governor-General

________________________________________________________________

156



[163]

SOLOMON ISLANDS INDEPENDENCE ORDER 1978

(LN. No. 43 of 1978)

APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS OF THE COMMITTEE ON THE 

PREROGATIVE OF MERCY

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 45(2) of the Constitution,

I, SIR, NATHANIEL RAHUMAEA WAENA, Knight Grand Cross of the Most

Distinguished Order of Saint Michael and Saint George, Cross of the Order of

Solomon Islands, Knight of Saint John, Governor-General and 

Commander-in-Chief of Solomon Islands, in my own deliberate judgment, do

hereby appoint -

EMMANUEL KOUHOTA to be Chairman; and

DR SILENT TOVOSIA

MRS JOAN AHIKAU

to be Members of the Committee on the Prerogative of Mercy for a period of Two

(2) years with effect from the date hereof.

Dated at Honiara this twenty-second day of July, 2005.

NATHANIEL RAHUMAEA WAENA

Governor-General

157



Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Ltd.



[Legal Notice No. 70]

SOLOMON ISLANDS INDEPENDENCE ORDER 1978

(L.N. No. 43 of 1978)

THE MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENTS) COMMISSION

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2005

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS

REGULATION

1. Short title

2. Deletion and substitution of reg. 9(2)

3. Amendment of reg. 11B(1)

4. Amendment of reg. 11B(2)

5. Amendment of reg. 11B(3)

6. Amendment of reg. 11B(3A)

7. Amendment of reg. 11B(4)

8. Amendment of reg. 11B(6)

9. Amendment of reg. 11B(7A)

10. Amendment of reg. 11B(20)

11. Amendment of reg. 11B31(1)

12. Amendment of reg. 31B(2)

13. Amendment of reg. 50(1)

14. Amendment of reg. 50(3)

15. Amendment of Part VII

16. Amendment of Appendix A

248

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Thursday   28th  July,  2005 S.I. No. 23



THE MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENTS) COMMISSION

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2005

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 69B(2) of the Constitution, the

Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission hereby makes the following

regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Members of Parliament

(Entitlements) Commission (Amendment) Regulations 2005, and shall be

deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of April 2005.

2. Regulation 9(2) of the principal Regulations* is hereby deleted

and the following substituted therefor -

“ 9. (2) Constituency allowance is for the purpose of a 

member touring his Constituency at least twice a year

and is not to be paid as part of basic salary but to be

drawn in two equal installments not being less than three

months apart.  The rate is as specified in Appendix A.”

3. Regulation 11B(1) of the principal Regulation is hereby of

amended by deleting the words “25%” and substituting therefor the words “30%”.

4. Regulation 11B(2) of the principal Regulation is hereby 

amended by deleting the words “35%” and substituting therefor the words “40%”.

5. Regulation 11B(3) of the principal Regulation is hereby 

amended by deleting the words “40%”  and substituting therefor the words

“45%’.

6. Regulation 11B(3A) of the principal Regulation is hereby

amended by deleting the words “40%” and substituting therefor the words “45%”.

7. Regulation 11B(4) of the principal Regulation is hereby amend-

ed deleting paragraph (a) thereof and substituting therefor the following -

11B. (4) A member who has held the office of the Prime

Minister for -

249

Short title

Deletion of
and
substitution of 
reg. 9(2)

Amendment 
of reg. 11B(1)

Amendment
of reg. 11B(2)

Amendment
of reg. 11B(3)

Amendment
of reg.
11B(3A)

Amendment
of reg. 11B(4)



“ (a) an aggregate period of more than 12 months shall be 

entitled to a life pension of 35% of the current annual basic salary

of the Prime Minister.”

8. Regulation 11B(6) of the principal Regulations is hereby 

amended by deleting the year “1976” and substituting therefor the year “1970”.

9. Regulation 11B(7A) of the principal Regulations is hereby the

following substituting therefor -

“ 11B. (7A.) Where a member of Parliament has died, his

pension shall be transferred to this surviving spouse until

she dies or remarries, whichever comes first.”

10. Regulation 20 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended in

the following respects -

(i) by adding at the end after the word “imprest” which 

appears at the beginning of the regulation the words 

“both or local and overseas travel”; and 

(ii) in paragraph (a) by adding after the words “dry cleaning”

the words “official gifts;”.

11. Regulation 31(1) of the principal Regulations is hereby amended

by deleting the words “Government house of Class II or III” and substituting

therefor the words “respectable and appropriate Government House”.

12. Regulation 31(2) of the principal Regulations is hereby deleted

and the following substituted therefor -

“ 31. (2) Any Minister or the Leader of the Opposition 

who occupies his own private house shall be

entitled to a rental supplement of $4,000-00 per

month.”

250

Amendment 
of reg. 11B(6)

Amendment
of reg.
11B(7A)

Amendment
of reg. 20

Amendment 
of reg. 31(1)

Amendment
of reg. 31(2)



13. Regulation 50(1) of the principal Regulations is hereby deleted
and the following substituted therefor -

“ 50. (1) Subsistence allowance is intended to cover for a
complete period of twenty-four hours service
charges, incidental expenses at the place
of accommodation, including unofficial
communication and transportation charges.”

14. Regulation 50(3) of the principal Regulations is hereby deleted
and the following substituted therefor -

“ 50. (3) Where a member is a guest of a host 
government, administration, agency or
organization, he may claim the full amount of
his subsistence allowance applicable to him, but
shall not be entitled to an imprest.”

15. Part VII of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by
inserting immediately after regulation 64A the following new 64B as follows -

“ 64B. The premiums for all insurance cover for all members of
Parliament is payable by the Government from the 
Consolidated Fund.”

16. Item 6 of the Appendix A (Terminal Grant) is hereby amended
by deleting the figure “$40,000.00” and substituting therefor the figure
“$50,000.00.”

Dated at Honiara this twenty-seventh day of July, 2005.

COLIN R. DARCY
Chairman

Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission
________________________________________________________________

251

Amendment
of reg. 50(1)

Amendment
of reg. 50(3)

Amendment
of Part VII

Amendment
of Appendix A



252

[Legal Notice No. 71]

THE PROVINCIAL GOVERNMENT ACT

(No. 7 of 1977)

THE PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLIES MEMBERS SALARIES

AND ENTITLEMENTS (AMENDMENT) AWARDS 2005

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 25 of the Provincial Government
Act, the Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission in consultation with
the Minister of Provincial Government, hereby makes the following salary and
entitlement awards in respect of elected members of all Provincial Assemblies as
follows -

1. These Awards may be cited as the Provincial Assemblies
Members Salaries and Entitlements (Amendment) Awards 2005, and shall be
deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of April 2005.

2. The Provincial Assemblies Members Salaries and Entitlements
Awards 1998* is hereby amended by deleting paragraph 2 thereof and
substituting therefor the following new paragraph 2 -

“2. SALARY

(a) For all Provinces $(per annum)
Premier $40,000.00
Deputy Premier $37,000.00
Executive Member $35,000.00
Members $25,000.00
Deputy Speaker $28,000.00.”

Dated at Honiara this twenty-seventh day of July, 2005.

COLIN R. DARCY
Chairman

Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission

*L.N. No. 86/1998.

Citation

Amendment
of paragraph 2



Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Ltd.


