
NO. 2  Thursday          6th    January,                                       2005

EXTRA ORDINARY GAZETTE

The following is published as a Supplement to this Gazette:

[Legal Notice Nos. 1 to 9]

______________________________________________________________

5



Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Ltd.



1

[Legal Notice No.  1]

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF

SERVICE) ACT

(Cap. 84)

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF

SERVICE) (CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2004

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices

(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Prime Minister hereby makes the 

following regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices

(Terms and Conditions of Service) (Chief Justice) (Amendment) Regulations

2004.

2. The Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service)

(Chief Justice) Regulations* is hereby amended in the following manner -

(a) in regulation 4, by deleting the figure “$64,397.18” and

substituting therefor the figure “$110,000.00”;

(b) in regulation 7, by inserting a comma immediately after

the word “gas” and adding the word “telephone” thereafter;

(c) in regulation 9, by deleting the word “a vehicle” and 

substituting therefor the words “two vehicles.”;

(d) in regulation 12(1), by deleting the figure “US$55.00” 

and substituting therefor the figure “US$250.00.”;

(e) in regulation 14, by deleting the figure “$40.00” and

substituting therefor the figure “$210.00.”; and 

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Thursday   6th   January,  2005 S.I. No. 1



2

(f) by inserting immediately after regulation 23 a new 

regulation 24 as follows -

“Compassionate 24. The Chief Justice shall 

be leave entitled to two return trips either by sea

or air within Solomon Islands on 

compassionate leave per annum.

Dated at Honiara this thirty-first day of December, 2004.

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA

Prime Minister

*L.N. 142/1990 (Cap. 84, p.2592)

_______________________________________________________________________

[Legal Notice No.  2]

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF

SERVICE) ACT

(Cap. 84)

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF

SERVICE) (PUISNE JUDGE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2004

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices

(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Prime Minister hereby makes the 

following regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices

(Termss and Conditions of Service) (Puisne Judge) (Amendment) Regulations

2004.

2. The Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) 

(Puisne Judge) Regulations* is hereby amended in the following

respects -

(a) in regulation 4, by deleting the figure “$60,948.90” and 

substituting therefor the figure “$85,000.00”;



3

(b) in regulation 7, by inserting a comma immediately after

the word “gas” and adding the word “telephone” thereafter, and 

(c) in regulation 15, by deleting the figure “$40.00” and 

substituting therefor the figure “$210.00.”

Dated at Honiara this thirty-first day of December, 2004.

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA

Prime Minister

*L.N. 142/1990 (Cap.84,p.2595)

_______________________________________________________________________

[Legal Notice No.  3]

THE SOLOMON ISLANDS NATIONAL PROVIDENT FUND ACT

( Cap. 109)

APPROVAL OF WITHDRAWAL OF AMOUNT STANDING TO THE

CREDIT OF JOSEPH TO’ORUMAE

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 28 of the Solomon Islands

National Provident Fund Act, the Board hereby approves and authorizes -

JOSEPH TO’ORUMAE

To withdraw the amount standing to his credit from the Solomon Islands National

Provident Fund.

Dated at Honiara this twenty-third day of December, 2004.



David K.C Quan

Chairman

Solomon Islands National Provident Fund Board

_________________________________________________________________

[Legal Notice No.  4]

SOLOMON ISLANDS NATIONAL PROVIDENT FUND ACT

(Cap. 109)

EXEMPTION ORDER

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 50(a) of the Solomon Islands

National Provident Fund Act, I, FRANCIS ZAMA, Minister of Finance hereby, in

consultation wih the Board, exempt -

JOSEPH TO’ORUMAE

From the requirements of Section 25(2) of the Solomon Islands National

Provident Fund Act.

Dated at Honiara this twenty-three day of December, 2004.

Francis Zama

Minister of Finance

_________________________________________________________________

[Legal Notice No.  5]

THE SOLOMON ISLANDS NATIONAL PROVIDENT FUND ACT

(Cap. 109)

APPROVAL OF WITHDRAWAL OF AMOUNT STANDING TO THE

CREDIT OF JOHN DUSARU

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 28 of the Solomon Islands National

Provident Fund Act, the Board hereby approves and authorizes -

4



JOHN DUSARU

To withdraw the amount standing to his credit from the Solomon Islands National

Provident Fund.

Dated at Honiara this twenty-third day of December, 2004.

David K.C Quan

Chairman

Solomon Islands National Provident Fund Board

_________________________________________________________________

[Legal Notice No.  6]

SOLOMON ISLANDS NATIONAL PROVIDENT FUND ACT

(Cap. 109)

EXEMPTION ORDER

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 50(a) of the Solomon Islands

National Provident Fund Act, I, FRANCIS ZAMA, Minister of Finance hereby, in

consultation with the Board, exempt -

JOHN DUSARU

From the requirements of Section 25(2) of the Solomon Islands National Provident

Fund Act.

Dated at Honiara this twenty-third day of December, 2004.

Francis Zama

Minister of Finance

_________________________________________________________________

[Legal Notice No.  7]

5



THE SOLOMON ISLANDS NATIONAL PROVIDENT FUND ACT

(Cap. 109)

APPROVAL OF WITHDRAWAL OF AMOUNT STANDING TO THE

CREDIT OF MICHAEL HAOMAE

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 28 of the Solomon Islands National

Provident Fund Act, the Board hereby approves and authorizes -

MICHAEL HAOMAE

Withdraw the amount standing to his credit from the Solomon Islands National

Provident Fund.

Dated at Honiara this twenty-third day of December, 2004.

David K.C Quan

Chairman

Solomon Islands National Provident Fund Board

_________________________________________________________________

[Legal Notice No.  8]

SOLOMON ISLANDS NATIONAL PROVIDENT FUND ACT

(Cap. 109)

EXEMPTION ORDER

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 50(a) of the Solomon Islands

National Provident Fund Act, I, FRANCIS ZAMA, Minister of Finance hereby, in

consultation with the Board, exempt -

MICHAEL HAOMAE

6



7

From the requirements of Section 25(2) of the Solomon Islands National

Provident Fund Act.

Dated at Honiara this twenty-third day of December, 2004.

Francis Zama

Minister of Finance



Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Ltd.


