91

."

,;E%-'* .+ SOLOMON ISLANDS GAZETTE

EY ALUTHORITY

NO. 38 Tuesday 10t April, 2018

EXTRAORDINARY GAZETTE

The following is published as a Supplement to this Gazette:
[Legal Notices No. 35 to 36]




Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the
Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Pacific Printers Limited.



127

S U P P LEM EN T to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Tuesday 10t April, 2018 S.I. No. 28

[Legal Notice No. 35]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2018

Table of provisions

Citation

Commencement
Regulations amended
Amendment of regulation 4

ENEROS I SR
[NCJ ST O \]



128

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF

SERVICE) (SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2018

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act (Cap. 84), I make these Regulations:

1

Citation

These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices (Terms
and Conditions of Service) (Speaker) (Amendment) Regulations 2018.

Commencement

These Regulations commence on the date they are published in the
Gazette.

Regulations amended

These Regulations amend the Constitutional Services (Terms and
Conditions of Service) (Speaker) Regulations (LN 144 of 1990).

Amendment of regulation 4

Regulation 4 is amended by deleting “$5,855.77” and substituting

“$8,652.19”.

MADE AT HONIARA this twentieth-third day of March, 2018.

HON. RICK HOUENIPWELA
PRIME MINISTER



129

[Legal Notice No. 36]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN PARLIAMENTARY ENTITLEMENTS
COMMISSION) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2018

Table of provisions

Citation

Commencement
Regulations amended
Amendment of regulation 3

LW o -
NS ST \O I\



130

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN) PARLIAMENTARY ENTITLEMENTS

COMMISSION) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2018

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act (Cap. 84), I make these Regulations:

1

Citation

These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices (Terms
and Conditions of Service) (Chairman Parliamentary Entitlements
Commission) (Amendment) Regulations 2018.

Commencement

These Regulations commence on the date they are published in the
Gazette.

Regulations amended

These Regulations amend the Constitutional Services (Terms and
Conditions of Service) (Chairman Parliamentary Entitlements
Commission) Regulations 2006.

Amendment of regulation 3

Regulation 3 is amended by deleting “$3,150.00” and substituting
“$6,459.32”

MADE AT HONIARA this twentieth-third day of March, 2018.

HON. RICK HOUENIPWELA
PRIME MINISTER

Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the
Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Pacific Printers Limited.



